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Breaking Bad is an American crime drama television series created and produced by Vince Gilligan for
AMC. Set and filmed in Albuquerque, New Mexico, the...

Hunter Dillon

of the Fox horror television series The Exorcist (2017). He guest starred as Sam on an episode of the CW
anthology series Two Sentence Horror Stories (2021)...

American Horror Story: Coven

The third season of the American horror anthology television series American Horror Story, subtitled Coven,
is set in 2013 New Orleans and follows a coven...

James Wan (category Australian horror film directors)

February 1977) is an Australian filmmaker. He has primarily worked in the horror genre as the co-creator of
the Saw and Insidious franchises and the creator...

Breaking Bad season 2

episodes form a sentence that reveals an event that takes place in the season finale (Seven Thirty-Seven
Down Over ABQ). The writers of Breaking Bad planned the...

List of characters in the Breaking Bad franchise

before the Breaking Bad events, Lalo tells Hector that Tuco has roughly a year left on his sentence. At the
start of events of Breaking Bad, Tuco is one of...

Ashlee Martinson

attention. Martinson later pleaded guilty to two counts of second degree intentional homicide and was
sentenced to 23 years in prison. Ashlee remained estranged...

Robert LaSardo

USA Cares, an organization that supports families of soldiers. 2014 Life Sentence: A true story about love,
lunacy and fame, CreateSpace Independent Publishing...

Amy Locane

eight-year sentence for a fatal DUI car crash that occurred in 2010. She had previously been sentenced to
three years in prison, of which she served two and...

If It Bleeds

drunk driver responsible for a beloved teacher&#039;s death receives a light sentence, Craig calls Mr.
Harrigan&#039;s phone and leaves a voicemail about the drunk...

Janet Kidder
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of Best Supporting Performance by a Female: Dramatic Series for Two Sentence Horror Stories episode
&quot;Elliot&quot;. &quot;Wild, wild West&quot; by Gayle MacDonald at...

The Horror of Party Beach

The Horror of Party Beach is a 1964 American horror film in the beach party genre, directed and co-
produced by Del Tenney. The film is described as &quot;a...

List of films considered the worst (redirect from List of movies that are famous for
being widely considered extremely bad)

aspect of this movie that isn&#039;t the Worst Thing Ever.&quot; The Standard&#039;s Bad Horror Club
noted its status as one of the worst films of all time, commenting:...

Bilkis Bano case

gangrape: 11 men sentenced to life imprisonment released from jail&quot;. Scroll.in. 16 August 2022.
&quot;Bilkis Bano case: Gujarat has set bad precedent by releasing...

Dennis Rodman (redirect from Bad as I Wanna Be)

years. After aborting a suicide attempt in 1993, he reinvented himself as a &quot;bad boy&quot; and became
notorious for numerous controversial antics. He repeatedly...

Murders of Channon Christian and Christopher Newsom (redirect from Knoxville
horror)

his sentence reduced from life in prison with the possibility of parole to 50 years (two 25-year terms with the
opportunity to reduce his sentence by up...

List of Black Mirror episodes

instalments have spanned a variety of genres including drama, psychological horror, political satire, and
romantic comedy. Black Mirror has been met with positive...

Bad Little Kid

&quot;Bad Little Kid&quot; is a short horror story by Stephen King, which was originally published in
German and French in an electronic version. The first paper...

Madea

two unruly skateboarders Netta and Dang Dang), two bench warrants, 25 unpaid parking tickets, and an
unpaid speeding ticket. Judge Michaels sentences...

Stephen King (redirect from King of Horror)

1947) is an American author. Widely known for his horror novels, he has been crowned the &quot;King of
Horror&quot;. He has also explored other genres, among them...
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